From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Cc:

Michael Petrovick mpetrovick@mijparchitect.com
RE: Bid

August 25, 2021 at 9:54 AM
Todd Croteau tcroteau @townofjaffrey.com, R Stephenson 5327653 @gmail.com
rob@rs41.org, Jon Frederick jfrederick@townofjaffrey.com

I’'m in another part of the state at a meeting at noon. | could be available via phone or Zoom at 3

pm on the 7%, 'm not available in person until the afternoon of the 14™ or 16™. 1 should be

included in this meeting.

Currently my calendar is booking 3-4 weeks out.

Michael J. Petrovick, NCARB, AlA
Principal

President-Elect | AIA New Hampshire

Please make note of our hours: M-Th 8am — 5pm, F 8am — 3pm.

MICHAELPETROVICK

ARCHITECTS,PLLC

51 Railroad Street Suite 140 100 Main Street Suite 207
Keene, NH 03431 Amesbury, MA 01913

P: 603.636.7056
M: 603.491.2536

www.mjparchitect.com
Licensed in NH, MA, ME and VT

From: Todd Croteau <tcroteau@townofjaffrey.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 25, 2021 9:03 AM

To: R Stephenson <5327653@gmail.com>; Michael Petrovick <mpetrovick@mijparchitect.com>
Cc: rob@rs41.org; Jon Frederick <jfrederick@townofjaffrey.com>

Subject: RE: Bid

Good morning all,

7th

| had a conversation with Bradley Davis. He states that he is available on September 7*" at 2pm or

3pm to review scope and schedule.

Kind regards,
Todd

Todd J. Croteau

Superintendent of Highways and Facilities
23 Knight Street

Jaffrey, NH 03452
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603-532-6521

From: R Stephenson <5327653@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, August 23, 2021 5:19 PM

To: Michael Petrovick <mpetrovick@mjparchitect.com>

Cc: rob@rs41.org; Jon Frederick <jfrederick@townofjaffrey.com>; Todd Croteau
<tcroteau@townofjaffrey.com>

Subject: Bid

Hi Michael,

| met with Jon Frederick and Todd Croteau today and Todd will contact Brad and see about a
meeting to talk about the project.

The dates mentioned were

Friday 3 September in the AM
Tuesday 7 September. Anytime

Do either of these work for you?

Question: LCHIP pays half of the project cost. Will they pay 1/2 of the contract price ($159,850) or
only 1/2 of our estimated cost ($137,000)?

Also, does LCHIP have to review/approve the contract?
Regards,
Rob

PS: my rob@rs41 email is acting up, hence gmail.

Robert Stephenson
5327653 @gmail.com
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